

**CITY OF COCONUT CREEK  
LAW ENFORCEMENT TRANSCRIPTION SERVICES  
BID NO. 01-24-24-11  
TABULATION**

<b>Event Number</b>	IFB No. 01-24-24-11	<b>Organization</b>	City of Coconut Creek, FL
<b>Event Title</b>	Law Enforcement Transcription Services	<b>Workgroup</b>	Procurement Division
<b>Event Description</b>	The City of Coconut Creek is seeking bids from qualified, experienced and licensed firm(s) to provide Law Enforcement Transcription Services.	<b>Event Owner</b>	Lorie Messer
<b>Event Type</b>	IFB	<b>Email</b>	lmesser@coconutcreek.net
<b>Issue Date</b>	1/7/2024 07:00:02 AM (ET)	<b>Phone</b>	1 (954) 956-1584
<b>Close Date</b>	1/24/2024 11:00:00 AM (ET)	<b>Fax</b>	1 (954) 973-6754

Responding Suppliers	City, State	Response Submitted	Lines Responded	Response Total
Always On Time (Jaime Caris)	Las Vegas, NV	1/23/2024 09:08:18 PM (ET)	9	\$15.50
VIQ Solutions, Inc	Phoenix, AZ	1/24/2024 10:40:49 AM (ET)	9	\$29.96
SpeakWrite, L.L.C.	Austin, TX	1/22/2024 11:14:51 PM (ET)	5	\$35.00
Capital Typing (Officemotive, Inc.)	Williston, SC	1/24/2024 10:19:47 AM (ET)	9	\$46.00
Ditto Transcripts	Denver, CO	1/18/2024 03:30:53 PM (ET)	9	\$96.25
DocuScript, LLC	Camp Hill, PA	1/24/2024 09:45:52 AM (ET)	9	\$114.76

Line #	Description	UOM	Always On Time (Jaime Caris)	VIQ Solutions, Inc.	SpeakWrite, L.L.C.	Capital Typing (Officemotive, Inc.)	Ditto Transcripts	DocuScript, LLC
			Unit	Unit	Unit	Unit	Unit	Unit
1.	Transcription Service - English	Page	\$2.00	\$2.98	\$3.00	\$1.50	\$3.25	\$3.50
2.	Transcription Service - English to Spanish	Page	\$4.00	\$4.68/minute	\$16.00	\$5.00	\$9.00	\$11.25
3.	Transcription Service - English to Creole	Page	No bid	\$15.00/minute	No Bid	\$7.00	\$18.00	\$20.00
4.	Transcription Service - English to All other foreign languages	Page	No bid	Per quote	No Bid	\$9.00	\$15.00	\$20.00
5.	Transcription Service - Spanish to English	Page	\$4.00	0.22/word	\$16.00	\$5.00	\$9.00	\$11.25
6.	Transcription Service - Creole to English	Page	No bid	0.44/word	No Bid	\$7.00	\$18.00	\$20.00
7.	Transcription Service - All other foreign languages to English	Page	No bid	Per quote	No Bid	\$9.00	\$15.00	\$20.00
8.	Upcharge for two-day service (2 business days)	Page	\$2.50	\$3.21	No charge	\$1.00	\$4.00	\$3.88
9.	Upcharge for next day service (1 business day)	Page	\$3.00	\$3.43	No charge	\$1.50	\$5.00	\$4.88

**NOTE: BID/RFP TABULATIONS ARE UNOFFICIAL UNTIL APPROVED BY CITY COMMISSION**